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	Project: Sign Materials - Section 1: Unfinished Sign Blanks
	Bid Amount 1: No Bid
	Bid Amount 2: No Bid
	Bid Amount 3: $16,743.56
	Bid Amount 4: $17,338.00
	Bid Amount 5: $17,886.20
	Bid Amount 6: $17,622.00
	Bid Amount 7: 
	Bid Amount 8: 
	Bid Amount 9: 
	Bid Amount 10: 
	1: American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc.
	2: US Wholesale Pipe & Tube, Inc.
	3: Osburn Associates, Inc.
	4: Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC
	5: Universal Signs & Accessories
	6: Vulcan Aluminum
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	Date: 05/12/2020
	Bid No: 2020-K
	Text3: No Bid
	Text4: $74,726.23
	Text5: $85,759.89
	Text6: $86,661.80
	Text7: $81,576.72
	Text8: 
	Text9: 
	Text10: 
	Text11: 
	Text2: No Bid
	Text1: Sign Materials - Section 2: ASTM Type III and Type IV High Intensity Prismatic
	Text19: 
	Text20: 
	Text21: 
	Text12: $60,044.30
	Text13: No Bid
	Text14: $66,168.50
	Text15: $50,284.00
	Text16: $55,526.00
	Text17: $52,960.56
	Text18: 
	Text22: Sign Materials - Section 3: Sign Sheeting
	Text23: Sign Materials - Section 4: U-Channel Posts
	Text30: 
	Text29: $30,975.50
	Text28: $27,012.50
	Text27: $30,551.00
	Text24: No Bid
	Text25: $33,472.00
	Text26: $7,862.50
	Text33: 
	Text32: 
	Text31: 
	Text34: Sign Materials - Section 5: Delineators
	Text39: $29,250.00
	Text40: $19,500.00
	Text41: 
	Text42: 
	Text35: No Bid
	Text36: No Bid
	Text37: $30,745.00
	Text38: $22,620.00
	Text43: 
	Text44: 
	Text45: Sign Materials - Section 6: MOT Equipment
	Text46: No Bid
	Text47: No Bid
	Text48: No Bid
	Text49: $12,955.00
	Text50: No Bid
	Text51: $15,916.30
	Text52: 
	Text53: 
	Text55: 
	Text54: 


